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Born and raised in Hong Kong, Stella’s love of this city is 
matched by her expertise in its residential real estate market. 
 
Stella has most recently set up her own boutique real estate 
company, Stellar Real Estate and focuses on local and 
international clients looking to buy, sell and rent Hong Kong 
real estate. 
 
From 2011 - 2018 Stella headed up the JLL residential 
leasing and relocation team where she was responsible for 
driving new business and ensuring that JLL’s activities were 
tailored to the needs of key corporate clients as well as 
institutional and individual landlords. 
  
Stella returned to Hong Kong in 2010 to continue her 
extremely successful real estate career. Her highly regarded 
international experience and knowledge of Hong Kong, 
coupled with her exceptional client skills, are just some of 
Stella’s strengths. Her passion lies in both people and 
property and she counts being proactive and tenacious 
amongst her personality traits. 
  
Stella has always played an active role championing women 
leaders within the Hong Kong business community, and was 
the Chair of the JLL Diversity & Inclusion Committee.  
Recently she has also had the privilege of being a Mentor as 
part of the The Women’s Foundation mentoring program. 
 
Stella enjoys a good netball game, swimming a few laps and      
of course travelling.  Stella has two children, Callum, 17 and 
Jessica10. 

  
 
 
 
 
 
 


